RFQ 18-001 Hall County Schools - High School Football Equipment
Approved vendor in the best interest of HCDS noted in Green

Pyramid | Owens Gopher School
Riddell | Products | Sporting Sport Specialty BSN
As Specified/ Lead . Lead . Lead . Lead . Lead . Lead .
#| Description | Manufacturer | Model# | (e | qry |fre| M| Tnel M| Toe | ) el R e ) R el o
General Specs Wks.) Wks.) Wks.) Wks.) Wks.) Wks.)

I I N N R N N N N N N S R S R S R R
1 [HELMETS RIDDELL SPEED As Specified | 100 4 190 No Bid 2| 195 No Bid No Bid 3| 194.98
1a RIDDELL SPEEDFLEX As Specified | 100 4 275 No Bid 195 No Bid No Bid 3| 206.98
2 |SHOULDER PADS Schutt 802658CCXX11| As Specified | 100 4 99 No Bid 155 2| 17857 No Bid 3| 154.55
3 |THIGH PADS PRO DOWN FBTPY  |As Specified |100 sets 4 4.9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 4.07
4 |KNEE PADS PRO DOWN FBKP30 As Specified | 100 sets 4 2.9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 1.52
5 |PRACTICE PANTS ALLESON 617LS  [suB 100 4 7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 12.95
6 |PRACTICE JERSEYS ALLESON 705 SUB 100 4 11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 2495
7 |MOUTHPIECES WILSON MG180  |SUB 150 4 035 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.35 2 0.28
8 |SHOULDER PAD RACK PRO DOWN 1187779 [suB 1 4 180 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2| 19455
9 |SIDELINE MARKERS PRO DOWN 1249361 [SUB 1 set 4 140 No Bid No Bid No Bid 83.95 2| 150.04
10| CHAIN set AND SUB 4 480 No Bid 209.61

DOWN BOX PRO DOWN 1379286 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2
11{END ZONE PYLONS PRO DOWN MSWPYLON |SUB 1 set 4 60, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 1841
12[SCRIMMAGE VESTS CHAMPRO FV SUB 48 4 4.95 2| 495 No Bid No Bid 1.81 2 1.96
13[KICK OFT TEE ATH. SPECIALTIES KKC2 SUB 3 4f 115 No Bid 2| 175 1 3.22 2.79 2| NoBid
14|EXTRA POINT TEE ATH. SPECIALTIES PT2 SUB 40 275 No Bid 2| 3.75 1 3.87 No Bid 2 1.55
15{GAME FOOTBALLS WILSON 1003 As Specified NO BID No Bid 2 791 1| 89.11 No Bid 2|  65.06
16|PRACTICE FOOTBALLS WILSON WTF1233B |As Specified | 12 NO BID 2| 435 2 54 1l 60.09 76.99 2| 47.27

DELUXE FIELD REPAIR
s ATH SPECIALTIES DRK As Specified | 2 4 e No Bid 2| 1515 No Bid NoBidl 5] NoBid
19| ELMET HARDWAR 4f 275 2| 3.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid

PACK ATH SPECIALTIES HKX As Specified | 2 No Bid 2

SHOULDER PAD
Blerastic ATH SPECIALTIES NPEB  |As Specified | 1 roll 4 21 No Bid 2 3 No Bid No Bid o| 2822
20|VARSITY MEDICAL KIT CRAMER 761206  |As Specified | 2 59 No Bid 2 64 No Bid 62.43 2| 57.27
21|WHITSLES FOX 40 WF40C  |As Specified | 12 4| 5356 No Bid No Bid 1 4.23 4.03 2 2.96
22|LANYARDS ATH SPECIALTIES LAN As Specified | 12 4 5.5 No Bid 2 1 No Bid 7.17 set 2 0.25
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23|SEGMENT TIMER General 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.77 2 1693.55
24|BALL INFLATOR ATH SPECIALTIES IPC SUB 2 4 | 7498 | 2 47 2 | 103 | 1 | 6825 50 2 | 63.24
25|LAZER FIELD STRIPER General 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 2973.13
26|ATHLEITC FIELD STIPER General 1 No Bid 95 No Bid 96.85 100 2 | 7756
27|FIELD PAINT ATH SPECIALTIES WLPW  |SUB 48 cases| 4 39 40 2 47 1 | 42.22 4093 | 2 | 37.39
28|POWER COOL TANKER General 1 4 | 1575 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1500 2 | 1156.96
| COOL POWER

TEAM DRINKER General 1 4 | 1125 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | 2 | 912.7
30|FOOTBALL BELTS ATH SPECIALTIES PWL2 SUB 150 4 1.2 No Bid| 2 2 No Bid 21.32/se 0.6

VARSITY KICKING
31l caGE PRO DOWN 1052480 [suB 4 160 No Bid No Bid 462.86 1550 78.59
32|TACKLE WHEEL FISHER TW4825  [suB 4 270 NoBid| 4 | 297 318.86 No Bid 278.48

VARSITY LINEMAN
33(cHuTE FISHER 9635HD  [suB 4 | 2175 NoBid| 4 | 1575 1618.71 No Bid 99.38
34|POP UP DUMMY FISHER 10155  |SUB 4 570 NoBid| 4 | 405 441 No Bid 390.76

HALF ROUND
35| AGILITY DUMMY FISHER HR488  |SUB 6 4 65 NoBid| 4 | 115 | 2 | 11957 NoBid | 3 | 105.95
36| ARM SHIELD DUMMY FISHER HD150  |SUB 4 38 No Bid| 4 57 58.89 NoBid | 2 | 2717
37|BLASTER FISHER BLASTER  [suB 1 2778 NoBid| 4 | 2573 | 2 |4177.29 NoBid | 3 |2500.54

ROUND BLOCKING
38| pumMMmY PRO DOWN SUD5416  [suB 6 4 150 NoBid| 4 | 159 | 2 | 109.85 NoBid | 2 | 11017
39|SLED FISHER 9715M  |SUB 1 6938 NoBid| 4 | 4545| 2 [4669.71 NoBid | 2 |2673.79
40|1 MAN SLED FISHER 9201R  |SuB 1 4 | 1676 NoBid| 4 |1030| 2 [1256.14 NoBid | 2 | 655.08
41|BULL RUSH SLED FISHER 9910PP [SuUB 1 No Bid NoBid| 4 | 1345 2 [1382.92 NoBid | 3 |1308.18
" PROTECTIVE TURF

MAT FISHER S115120 |SUB 1 No Bid No Bid 2 |1387.28 NoBid | 2 | 1282.8
43|GOAL POST PAD FISHER GPP407 |[SUB 2 4 185 NoBid| 4 [409pr 462.85 4425 | 3 | 383.11
44(SPEED LADDERS FISHER AGL4815 |SUB 2 4 63 No Bid| 4 120 2 | 11571 42.74 3 | 109.46
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45|FIELD STENCIL KIT FISHER 3600DLX |SUB 1 4 625 No Bid| 4 674 1 699.42 No Bid 3 661.62
HELMET INFLATOR
“8lpump General 3 4 | 75 No Bid NoBid| 1 | 7.77 NoBid | 2 | 432
47 SCRIMMAGE SUB
HELMET COVERS ATH SPECIALTIES SCP 24 4 5.75 14 | 2.25 2 9 1 5.17 No Bid 2 1.79
48| TRAINING TABLES General 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
49|HELMET DECALS DECALS General 120 4 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 4.27
50|Ear Pads RIDDELL SPEED As Specified [24 SETS| 4 18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51|GAME PANTS NIKE NA As Specified 200 6 77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12 | 109.95
52|GAME PANTS NIKE NA As Specified | 100 6 68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | 12 64.95
53(JV JERSEYS ALLESON/NIKE NA As Specified 72 6 21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 32.95
54[JV PANTS ALLESON/NIKE NA As Specified | 36 6 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | 3 15.95
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